
Buddhism with Heritage

Duration : 10 Nights / 11 Days
Destinations : Delhi - Jaipur – Agra - Jhansi - Khajuraho - Varanasi - 
Bodhgaya - Rajgir - Nalanda - Patna -  Delhi

Day 01: Arrive Delhi

Land at the airport in Delhi and check into the hotel. Delhi is the capital city of India and 
the parliamentary headquarters are located here. Stay for the night at the hotel. 

Day 02: Delhi

Go for sightseeing tours to Delhi and see the Jama Masjid, Red Fort, India Gate, Gandhi 
memorial, Parliament House, Qutab Minar, Humayun’s Tomb and other places. Stay for 
the night at the hotel. 

Day 03: Delhi – Jaipur 

After you have breakfast, make driving trips to Jaipur and see the Amer Fort. You can 
take the elephant or the jeep to ascend the fort. Later come back to Jaipur and go to the 
Jantar Mantar. Stay for the night at the hotel. 

Day 04: Jaipur – Agra 

After having breakfast, start for the trip to Agra. On the route, go to Fatehpur Sikri and 
see the wonderful architecture. After coming to Agra, transfer to the hotel and relax. 
Later in the day, go to the Taj Mahal, Agra Fort and other tourist spots. 

Day 05: Agra – Jhansi - Khajuraho 

Go to the Agra cant railway station and take the train to Jhansi. After coming to the place, 
take the car to Khajuraho which is around 4 hours away. Arrive and check into the hotel. 
In the afternoon, go for sightseeing trips to the Khajuraho Temple. Night stay at 
Khajuraho. 

Day 06: Khajuraho - Varanasi 



At dawn, make a sightseeing tour of Khajuraho. Later in the day, come to the airport and 
take a flight to Varanasi. Transfer to the hotel after you arrive. Stay for the night. 

Day 07: Varanasi 

In the morning, make trip to the Ghats and participate in the worship ceremonies. Make 
an excursion trip on the Ganges. 

Have breakfast; go to Sarnath which is around 10 kms away. It is an ancient site of 
Buddhist learning. Later in the day, come to the Vishwanath Temple and the Durga 
Temple. Over night stay will be at Varanasi. 

Day 08: Varanasi - Bodhgaya 

Go to Bodhgaya after you have breakfast. It is also a well known place for Buddhist 
learning. Check in at the hotel after you arrive and stay for the night. 

Day 09: Bodhgaya 

Have breakfast and go for sightseeing trips to various tourist attractions in Bodhgaya. In 
the afternoon, spend time in leisure. Stay for the night at Bodhgaya. 

Day 10: Bodhgaya - Rajgir - Nalanda – Patna

Have breakfast and drive to Patna. On the route, stop at Rajgir and get a feel of the scenic 
beauty and rich culture. Later in the day, make trips to the ruins of Nalanda. Transfer to 
the hotel after reaching Patna. 

Day 11: Patna - Delhi 

Have breakfast and make sightseeing trip of Patna. Later take a flight o Delhi. On arrival, 
go to the hotel. 

Relax for some time and go to the international airport o board the onward flight. 

Tourist Attractions 

Delhi
• Red Fort
• Jama Masjid
• India Gate
• Humayun’s Tomb

Jaipur
• Jantar Mantar
• Amer Fort



• Hawa Mahal
• City Palace 

Varanasi
• Sarnath 
• Vishwanath Temple
• Durga Temple


